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Assesses the layered meanings and persistent global legacy of an American film classic.

Five decades after the production and initial release of Rebel Without a Cause, this book examines both the
complicated historical moment in which the film was made as well as its continuing and pervasive influence
on film today. The contributors track how the film continues to speak to diverse audiences as a touchstone
for imagined anxieties over adolescence and coming-of-age, traditional values of family and community,
threats from abroad, and the provocations of mass or consumer society. Although the specific sources and
motivations for rebellion have shifted, what has persisted is the film’s singular power to represent rebellion
in what could otherwise be seen as the everyday, and to move viewers to ponder its causes.

J. David Slocum is Associate Dean of the Graduate School of Arts and Science at New York University and
is the editor of Violence and American Cinema.
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From reader reviews:

Enoch Dutton:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content.
As you may know that book is very important normally. The book Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a
Maverick Masterwork (SUNY series, Horizons of Cinema) seemed to be making you to know about other
understanding and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The book
Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick Masterwork (SUNY series, Horizons of Cinema) is not
only giving you much more new information but also to become your friend when you experience bored.
You can spend your own spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the book Rebel
Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick Masterwork (SUNY series, Horizons of Cinema). You never
truly feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Armando Mosley:

Do you among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
this particular aren't like that. This Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick Masterwork (SUNY
series, Horizons of Cinema) book is readable by you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the
data here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that
want to deliver to you. The writer connected with Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick
Masterwork (SUNY series, Horizons of Cinema) content conveys thinking easily to understand by most
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you
nonetheless thinking Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick Masterwork (SUNY series,
Horizons of Cinema) is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Michael Larose:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This book Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick
Masterwork (SUNY series, Horizons of Cinema) was multi-colored and of course has pictures around. As we
know that book Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick Masterwork (SUNY series, Horizons of
Cinema) has many kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Private investigator
Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you
bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like
reading that will.

Elizabeth Rogers:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the
very best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as of
book Rebel Without a Cause: Approaches to a Maverick Masterwork (SUNY series, Horizons of Cinema).
You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and



make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one place
to other place.
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