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In a major reassessment of African American culture, Phillip Brian Harper intervenes in the ongoing debate
about the “proper” depiction of black people. He advocates for African American aesthetic
abstractionism—a representational mode whereby an artwork, rather than striving for realist verisimilitude,
vigorously asserts its essentially artificial character.  Maintaining that realist representation reaffirms the
very social facts that it might have been understood to challenge, Harper contends that abstractionism shows
up the actual constructedness of those facts, thereby subjecting them to critical scrutiny and making them
amenable to transformation.
 
Arguing against the need for “positive” representations, Abstractionist Aesthetics displaces realism as the
primary mode of African American representational aesthetics, re-centers literature as a principal site of
African American cultural politics, and elevates experimental prose within the domain of African American
literature. Drawing on examples across a variety of artistic production, including the visual work of Fred
Wilson and Kara Walker, the music of Billie Holiday and Cecil Taylor, and the prose and verse writings of
Ntozake Shange, Alice Walker, and John Keene, this book poses urgent questions about how racial
blackness is made to assume certain social meanings. In the process, African American aesthetics are
upended, rendering abstractionism as the most powerful modality for Black representation. 
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From reader reviews:

Leslie Heidelberg:

Within other case, little people like to read book Abstractionist Aesthetics: Artistic Form and Social Critique
in African American Culture (NYU Series in Social and Cultural Analysis). You can choose the best book if
you love reading a book. As long as we know about how is important a book Abstractionist Aesthetics:
Artistic Form and Social Critique in African American Culture (NYU Series in Social and Cultural
Analysis). You can add information and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right,
because from book you can recognize everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will be
known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book
as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to
the library. Let's go through.

Dan Villanueva:

This Abstractionist Aesthetics: Artistic Form and Social Critique in African American Culture (NYU Series
in Social and Cultural Analysis) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is information inside this publication incredible
fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get.
This Abstractionist Aesthetics: Artistic Form and Social Critique in African American Culture (NYU Series
in Social and Cultural Analysis) without we comprehend teach the one who reading it become critical in
pondering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Abstractionist Aesthetics: Artistic Form and Social
Critique in African American Culture (NYU Series in Social and Cultural Analysis) can bring when you are
and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it with your lovely
laptop even telephone. This Abstractionist Aesthetics: Artistic Form and Social Critique in African American
Culture (NYU Series in Social and Cultural Analysis) having good arrangement in word and layout, so you
will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Gordon Miller:

In this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more special than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to
do is just spending your time not very much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of many
books in the top record in your reading list is Abstractionist Aesthetics: Artistic Form and Social Critique in
African American Culture (NYU Series in Social and Cultural Analysis). This book which can be qualified
as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upward and review this
book you can get many advantages.

Cara Shaver:

A lot of publication has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the



top book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is named of book
Abstractionist Aesthetics: Artistic Form and Social Critique in African American Culture (NYU Series in
Social and Cultural Analysis). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it
may add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware
about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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