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It has never been easy for new authors to find a publisher but in the last few years it has become significantly
harder. In 2008, the average author earned less than £7000 per annum. According to The Times
approximately 200,000 books were available for sale in the UK in 2007. Of that total, 190,000 titles sold
fewer than 3,500 copies. The top 5% of titles by sales volume accounted for over 60% of total book sales. No
wonder publishers are careful about signing new writers. But there is good news in amongst all the doom and
gloom. Right now, it has never been easier to be published. Everyone who posts something on Facebook is in
effect a published author. And some blogs are read by tens of thousands of people daily, many more than
might pick up a physical book by the same author. Then there's self-publishing, vanity publishing, print on
demand and so on. But how do you find your way round this minefield? Get published has been written by
publishing insiders to help new authors understand the way publishers think and set about publishing if they
can't get a commercial publisher interested.
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From reader reviews:

Frances Heath:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or maybe goal; it means that
e-book has different type. Some people experience enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book.
These are reading whatever they get because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person
who don't like examining a book? Sometime, man feel need book once they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will require this Get Published.

Calvin Fischer:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the resources
inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each data they get. How people have to be smart in
getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Studying a book can help persons
out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Get Published book as this book offers you rich facts and
knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably
know this.

Alice Ybarra:

Beside this Get Published in your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or
details. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh through the oven so don't possibly be
worry if you feel like an previous people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Get Published
because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get
what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable
arrangement here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the
idea? Find this book and read it from now!

Haydee Todd:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a guide. They are directly felt the idea when they
get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book Get Published to make your own reading is
interesting. Your own skill of reading proficiency is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose
basic book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the feeling about book and reading through especially. It
is to be 1st opinion for you to like to open a book and examine it. Beside that the guide Get Published can to
be your new friend when you're sense alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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